Eric Sanborn

From: Courtney Gabbara <cgabbara@cstmlaw.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 5:31 PM

To: Carol Jonckheere

Cc: Nicole Moles; Eric Sanborn

Subject: [EXT] RE: SHERIFF: AXON - In-Car Recording Systems

"The e-mail below is from an external source. Please do not open attachments or click links from an unknown or suspicious
origin."

Lt. Sanborn,

| just want to confirm there are no other appendixes that go along with the Master Agreement for this particular quote.
If not, then I’'m comfortable with the revisions as we made them last time.

Once | hear confirmation from you, | will have my legal assistant, Nicole, update my approval as to form.
Best,
Courtney

Courtney A. Gabbara, Esq.
Cohl, Stoker & Toskey, P.C.
601 N. Capitol Avenue
Lansing, M| 48933
517-372-9000
cgabbara@cstmlaw.com

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is
confidential, proprietary, attorney work-product or attorney-client privileged. If this information is received by anyone other
than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by E-MAIL and by telephone (517-372-
9000) and obtain instructions as to the disposal of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be read, used,
copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of
the sender or the named addressee(s). Thank you.

From: Carol Jonckheere <Clonckheere@livgov.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 26, 2021 5:22 PM

To: Courtney Gabbara <cgabbara@cstmlaw.com>

Cc: Gwen Kamm <gkamm@cstmlaw.com>; Nicole Moles <nmoles@cstmlaw.com>; Eric Sanborn
<ESanborn@livgov.com>; Mike Murphy <MMurphy@livgov.com>

Subject: SHERIFF: AXON - In-Car Recording Systems

RESOLUTION #2021-01-014 AUTHORIZING AN AGREEMENT WITH AXON TO PROVIDE MOBILE IN-CAR
RECORDING SYSTEMS FOR PATROL VEHICLES - SHERIFF

Hi Courtney. You recently reviewed AXON’s Master Services and Purchase Agreement, which is why
you are the lucky winner to be selected for review of the attached Quote #*Q-281385-
44217.759IM! This Quote is for purchase of In-Car Recording Systems for Patrol Vehicles, which
was approved at Monday’s Board Meeting via Resolution #2021-01-014.
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Unfortunately, in order to lock in this pricing, we need your review returned and the Quote
executed by late morning, this Friday, January 29"l The following has been attached for your
review:

Resolution and Cover Letter;
Quote #Q-281385-44217.759JM; and,

3. Master Services and Purchase Agreement - Previously reviewed and
approved under Resolution #2020-06-161.

Should you have any questions, please feel free to contact Lt. Eric Sanborn directly at
esanborn@livgov.com.

Thank you for your prompt attention to this matter and | do apologize for the short turnaround
time involved.

CAROL SUE JONCKHEERE

EXECUTIVE AsST / CONTRACT ADMINISTRATOR
LIVINGSTON COUNTY ADMINISTRATION
#517-546-3669 / carolj@livgov.com




